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OVERVIEW 
 
Small Claims Court (SCC) is a division of the General 
District Courts for the Counties and independent cities of 
Virginia.  SCC jurisdiction is limited to civil cases in 
which the plaintiff is seeking a money judgment or 
recovery of personal property valued up to $5,000.     
 
In trials before the small claims court, the judge conducts 
the trial in an informal manner. The judge has the 
discretion to admit all non-privileged relevant evidence. 
Attorneys are typically not allowed in SCC.  If an 
attorney appears to represent a client, the judge will not 
hear the case, but require it to be heard at General 
District Court. Once a case is filed it typically takes at 
least 21 days for the paperwork to be finalized.  SCC is 
held once per week (for Hampton it is on Thursdays) and 
there is a limited docket.  For example, if the docket has 
a limit of seven cases, once the seven spots are filled, a 
ready case can only be scheduled for the next available 
spot.   
 
A successful plaintiff in a civil case will typically be 
awarded a money judgment as compensation for the 
defendant's wrongful act. The plaintiff is never assured 
of actually receiving the money, however, since the 
judgment can only be enforced out of property belonging 
to the defendant. A defendant in a civil case is not 
subject to criminal sanctions for failing to pay.  
 

PREPARING TO FILE SUIT 
 
It is essential in filing suit that the plaintiff knows the 
defendant's current address. Businesses that are trading 
under an assumed name are required by law to file a 
fictitious name statement in the clerk's office of the local 
circuit court.  
 
For example, if Jane Roe owns a corporation called Roe 
Corporation that is doing business under the name "Roe 
Jewelry," a suit would be brought against "Roe 
Corporation trading as Roe Jewelry." The fictitious name 
statement would indicate that Roe Corporation owned 
"Roe Jewelry" and would list an address for the 
corporation, as "Roe Corporation, c/o Jane Roe, 102 Park 
Street, Roeville, Virginia."  
 
If the defendant is a corporation, a simple way to locate 
the address is to call the registered agent division of the 
State Corporation Commission in Richmond, (804) 371-
9967. That office will provide the name and address of 

the corporation's registered agent. The address needed to 
bring suit against the corporation is, for example, "XYZ 
Corp., c/o John Doe, Registered Agent, 1402 Fish Lane, 
Fishtown, Virginia." 
 
If the defendant is an individual and the home address 
cannot be located, a work address will suffice, although a 
home address is preferable. 
 

FILING SUIT 
 
The plaintiff will be asked to fill out a civil warrant or a 
civil summons form which contains space for the details 
of your claim. If the plaintiff is seeking only a money 
judgment, he or she should prepare and file a warrant in 
debt. If the plaintiff is seeking to obtain possession of 
specific personal property, the plaintiff should prepare 
and file a warrant in detinue. The plaintiff will need to 
bring to the clerk the following:  
 

1. The name of the defendant;  
2. The current address of the defendant; 
3. The amount of the plaintiff's claim; 
4. The basis of the claim; and  
5. Sufficient funds to pay the filing fee and any 

sheriff's fee for serving the warrant.  
 
The amount required may vary, so you may want to 
inquire with the court about the cost. The fees must be 
paid in cash, by certified check, or by money order. If 
you are preparing a civil warrant, you should make two 
extra copies, one to keep for your own records and one to 
mail to the defendant, in addition to the number of copies 
requested by the clerk for processing by the court. 
 
In preparing a warrant in debt, the claim must specify a 
dollar amount and the reason for the claim. In preparing 
a warrant in detinue, the plaintiff must describe the 
specific property being sought, state its value, and state 
the basis of the claim for possession of the property. 
 
One additional step is taken by careful plaintiffs. A copy 
of the civil warrant is sent by first-class mail by the 
plaintiff to the defendant at least ten (10) days before the 
date when the plaintiff and defendant are to come to 
court for their first appearance in the dispute. Further, the 
plaintiff should fill out a Certificate of Mailing, which is 
either delivered to the judge at the trial or delivered to 
the clerk's office before the date of the trial. Otherwise, 
the plaintiff cannot get judgment on the trial date if the 
defendant fails to come to court (which happens 
frequently), and the case will be continued until the 
required ten-day notice has been given. 
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SERVICE OF PROCESS 

 
After the clerk completes the clerk's portion of the civil 
warrant prepared by the plaintiff, these papers are sent to 
the sheriff of the county or city where the defendant is 
located or the plaintiff may utilize a private process 
server to serve the papers on the defendant. This is 
known as service of process.  
 
Without service of process having been made, the court 
cannot try the case. If you are suing a corporation, an 
out-of-state defendant, or if service of process cannot be 
made by the deputy sheriff or private process server, you 
should contact the clerk to inquire as to how service of 
process may be issued and what fees (if any) are 
involved. 
 
If the only available address of the defendant is a work 
address, the civil warrant must be served in person. 
Sometimes, it can be difficult for a deputy sheriff or 
private process server to locate someone at work, and the 
sheriff's department or private process server will only 
make a limited number of attempts to serve process 
before returning the civil warrant or summons to the 
court unserved. 
 

RETURN OF THE WARRANT 
 
The civil warrant will include a specific date and time 
when the defendant and the plaintiff are to come to court 
for their trial concerning their dispute. This date is 
sometimes called the "return date." All of the cases 
scheduled for trial on the same date may require the 
parties to appear at the same time. However, the cases 
will be called one at a time, and the parties will approach 
the judge concerning their case. 
 
If the civil warrant was served on the defendant in a 
legally correct way and he or she fails to appear on the 
return date, a "default judgment" may be entered against 
the defendant. In this situation, the court will enter a 
judgment for the plaintiff on the trial date based on 
evidence from the plaintiff supporting the claim. The 
defendant has lost the case. 
 
If the civil warrant was served by "posting" (attaching) 
the civil warrant to the front door of the defendant's 
residence, an additional step is required before default 
judgment will be entered. The plaintiff must certify to 
the court that at least ten days before the entry of default 
judgment, the plaintiff mailed to the defendant at his or 
her residence, by ordinary first-class mail, a copy of the 
civil warrant. A form Certificate, form DC-413, may be 
used for this purpose. Otherwise, the case will be 
continued, and the plaintiff must return to court for the 
default judgment after the ten-day period has elapsed.  

 
If the plaintiff fails to appear in court, the defendant may 
ask the judge to decide the case in the defendant's favor. 
 
The defendant has the right to remove the case to the 
general district court by completing the Removal to 
General District Court form on the back of the civil 
warrant and giving it to the clerk or judge. This notice 
must be filed before the judge decides the case. 
 

TRIAL PROCEDURES 
 
Generally, all parties represent themselves in actions 
before the small claims court.  
 
If a party wishes to call witnesses besides himself, he or 
she should consider having them served with a subpoena, 
even if the witness has willingly agreed to appear at the 
trial or is a defendant. If the witness has received the 
subpoena at least five days before trial and if his or her 
testimony is important to the case, the judge will usually 
continue the case until a later date (if requested) should 
the witness not appear. Otherwise, the trial usually will 
proceed without that witness. 
 
To subpoena a witness, the party must file a Request for 
Witness Subpoena, form DC-325, in the Small Claims 
Division of the clerk's office at least 10 days before the 
trial. This requirement is made so that the witness can 
receive the subpoena at least five days before trial as 
required by law. The party will need to give the name 
and current home address of the prospective witness.  
 
It is important always to notify your witnesses (except 
the other party) before they receive their subpoenas. 
Witnesses taken by surprise may be angered, and less 
willing to be of use in court. Explain to a witness why 
you need his or her testimony and try to convince the 
witness to come willingly. Any party is entitled to 
subpoena any witness, willing or not, but a willing 
witness will be more helpful in court.  
 
You will be required to pay an additional sheriff's fee for 
the service of any subpoenas for witnesses. 
 

TRIAL 
 
Each case is tried in an informal manner. Both plaintiff 
and defendant will be given an opportunity to introduce 
evidence, ask questions of the witnesses, and to explain 
to the judge why the judge should enter judgment in his 
favor. While the judge has the discretion to admit 
evidence of probative value even if it does not comply 
with all of the legal requirements, he may not allow 
witnesses to testify until they have been sworn and he 
may not consider "privileged communications" 
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(statements by certain people barred by law from being 
used in a trial).  
 

JUDGMENT IS ENTERED 
 
At the end of the case, the judge will either enter 
judgment for the plaintiff or the defendant. If the 
judgment is for the plaintiff, it may be the amount sought 
by the plaintiff, or it may be less. The person who has the 
burden of proof must not only prove that he or she is 
entitled to win the case, but must prove the amount due. 
Form DC-475, Civil Appeal Notice, is used for filing an 
appeal. The appeal will be tried in circuit court in a 
formal manner strictly following all of the rules of 
evidence and procedure, and in which lawyers usually 
represent the parties. 
 

APPEALS 
 
So long as the amount in controversy exceeds $50, either 
the plaintiff or the defendant has a right to appeal any 
decision of the general district court to the circuit court, 
the next highest court in the Virginia system. After a 
party notes an appeal, which is done usually at the end of 
the trial but must be done within ten days after the entry 
of judgment, the judge will set an appeal bond of a 
certain amount of money. Within 30 days after judgment 
is entered, an appealing party post the required bond with 
the clerk of the court. In circuit court, a jury may be 
requested if the claim exceeds $100. 
 

ENFORCING THE JUDGMENT 
 
The judgment of the court is, in itself, nothing but an 
official statement in the court's records that the 
defendant, now also called the judgment debtor, owes the 
plaintiff, the judgment creditor, a certain amount of 
money with interest. The judgment must be enforced out 
of the assets of the defendant.  
 
To enforce the collection of the judgment, the judgment 
creditor may contact the general district court clerk's 
office for additional information on court procedures to 
collect the judgment, including:  
 

• Using a Summons to Answer Interrogatories for 
getting information about the defendant and his 
assets in order to use court collection 
procedures.  

• Obtaining an Abstract of Judgment to take to 
circuit court for recording as a lien against real 
estate.  

• Obtaining a Writ of Fieri Facias to have the 
judgment debtor's personal property sold at 
public auction to pay the judgment.  

• Obtaining a Garnishment Summons to get 
payment from the judgment debtor's bank 
account or earnings.  

 
Note: The information in this handout is general in 
nature.  It is not to be used as a substitute for legal 
advice from an attorney regarding individual 
situations.   
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